BILL NO. 01 OF 2022

THE DELHI SIKH GURDWARAS
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022

(As intr«odgced in the Legislative Assembly of the National
Capital Territory of Delhi on 03 January, 2022)

G

RAJ KUMAR
~ Secretary
Delhi Legislative Assembly
Old Secretariat, Delhi-110054



ANNEXURE-‘A’

BILL No. ©/ _ OF 2022

THE DELHI SIKH GURDWARAS (AMENDMENT) BILL,
2022
A
BILL
further to amend the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971.

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National

Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventieth second of the Republic of
India as follows:-

1. Short title, extent and commencement- (1) This Act may be called
the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment) Act,2022.

(2) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.
(3) It shall come into force with immediate. effect.

2. Amendment of Section 4 — In the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971
(82 of 1971), in clause (b) of Section 4,------—---

(i) for the words “nine members”, the words “ten members” shall be
substituted;

(ii) In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Section 4,-—--

(a) for the words “four members”, the words “five members”shall be
substituted;




(b) the word “and” shall be omitted:

(c) after the words “Sri Takhat Hazur Sahib, Nanded”, the words
brackets and figure “and (5) Sri Takhat Damdama Sahib, Talwandi
Sabo, Bhatinda, Punjab” shall be inserted.

Rajendra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Welfare,
SC/8T. WCD, Co-operative, GE

Govt. of NCT of Delhi




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

1. The need for the amendment in the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971, arises
out of representation of the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Management Committee for
inclusion of ‘Sri Takhat Damdama Sahib, Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda (Punjab)’ as
fifth “Takhat” in the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971 by making amendment in
the said Act and in continuation to the order dated 01.06.2018 by the Delhi
High Court in the matter of W.P.(C) No. 6377/2018 for considering the
representation of The Delhi Sikh Gurdwara Management Committee.

Further, ’Sri Takhat Damdama Sahib, Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda (Punjab)’has
already been included as the fifth Takhat in the Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1925
(Punjab Act VIII of 1925) by the Ministry of Home Affairs, Govt. of India V|de
notification NO. S.0.281(E) dated 23.04.1999.

2. Sub-clause (ii), clause (b) of Section 4 of the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act, 1971
provides that the committee shall consist of four members, each being the
head priest of the (1) Sri Akal Takhat Sahib, Amritsar (2) Sri Takhat Kesgarh

Sahib, Anandpur (3) Sri Takhat Patna Sahib, Patna and (4) Sri Takhat Hazur
Sahib, Nanded.

3. In the above background appropriate amendments are proposed to be made
and clause (b) in sub-clause (ii) of Section 4 of the Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras Act,
1971 by making the following amendments as under:-

(i) In clause (b) of Section 4 of the Act, of the words ‘nine members’ the words
‘ten members’ shall be substituted

(i) In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Section 4, ---

(a) for the words “four Members”, the words “five
members” shall be substituted.

(b) the word “and” shall be omitted: \/-:/

fu" J’I Tﬂth—‘:‘ o



(c) after the words “Sri Takhat Hazur Sahib, Nanded”, the words
brackets and figure “and (5) Sri Takhat Damdama Sahib,
Talwandi Sabo, Bhatinda, Punjab” shall be inserted.

4. The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

Date:-
Place:-

(RAJENDRA PAL GAUTAM)
Minister of Directorate of Gurdwara Elections

Govt. of NCT of Delhi
Rajendra Pal Gautam




MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment) Bill, 2022 does not seek to confer
any power of legislation on any subordinate functionaries. " 0

/_-
(RAJENDRA PAL GAUTAM)

Minister of Directorate of Gurdwara Elections
Govt. of NCT of Delhi

1

Raieridra Pal Gautam
o 9 ial Ialfare
Minister of Social \K-;:;%alk,,
/ST, WCD. Co-operative, GE
il L WP e B A L) ;

Govt. of NCT of Delhi




FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Delhi Sikh Gurdwaras (Amendment) Bill, 2022 does not involve any
financial implications from the Consolidation Fund of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi. >

g

(RAJENDRA PAL GAUTAM)
Minister of Directorate of Gurdwara Elections
Govt. of NCT of Delhi

Raiendra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Welfare,

arative GE
WCD, Co-operative, Lk
Covt of NCT of Dethi

U




2022 T fAegs d&ai® 01

oo ﬁl@r TOERT (|eNer)
faeraes, 2022

K‘—- =
\ Y | -
{ | - vy
i { ﬁ
\ 7 [
L V

(Srefes wrsfia e & Reeh o R war &
festiar 03 W, 2022 P eRmiya o )

@\\//
TS PHAR
e

fReeht Rurm wa
R Wi, fieh—110064



T~

2022 &1 fdgs gen o1
fewet Rra Teart @=iwm) fduss, 2022
feeelt Rra Teert ofdfam, 1971 & o Oxiem & Ryw

U
EBRED

YR TR & S8leRd a4 & T ot a9 Reeh & fRum aw g
3 Farer sifdfafa fear s -

1. digw five, TR wd uRy- (1) I8 g il Ra Togr
(M) 9T, 2022 HEART |

(2) 98 Ul AP IweE a8 e § fawaia @
(3) UG dbTd UHE § oL 8N |

2. URT 4 BT WRYF - ool Rr@ Tegrr offom, 1971 (1071 @7 82),
URT 4 & WS (W) #, -

() "N FEW " YAl B WA W eY Go  Ued] @ ufeni| fear
GlTaTH; ' ‘

(i) ¥URT 4 & WS (@) & IU-TWg (i) §-

@) IR TR T F WA R U wowl vl @ e R
ST ‘

ajendra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Welfare,
SC/ST, WCD, Co-operative, GE
Govt. of NCT of Delhi




() "qUT" sq DI T ST

g)g%ﬁﬂ@@%ﬁ,ﬁ",ﬂﬁ%llm" adT (5) ot 9=d gHEHT

SITUT |
)

-
-

Rajenidra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Wellare,
SC/ST, WCD, Co-operative, GE
Govt. of NCT of Delhi




3¢c2Y 3R HROT 1 faexor

1. Reeel @ spegrr yaues afdfa & ufddea o st qed goean
Tifed, TerdsT Arq, #iEeT (dorma)” o gied "aea 7 afde e &
39 @ foell R@ eerr 3fwer 971 & @dam &
ATITFRAT Scud g‘é ¢ | feoell @ segrr yaus afafa &
ufdded o AR &ta & faw WP(C) g% 6377/2018 & aaer
ATART 3Td =11 feeell & gRT T 01.06.2018 & 3162r hr
fAaTar # sws 3rfAfATe & Govys forar o |

58 3elral " ded GHAGHT ATfed, delas TTe, HiEsT (Gaira)” &t
urad A% & ®Y H IE FAIAT, HRT TR §RT feeTied 23.04.1999
I SIRY JTTGEAT  B1.3HT.281(3) F 3R RE TRt 3T,
1925 (1925 T USTTe ATATAIT VIII) & 3iqeta nfdrer fhar =ar § |

2. feeeh R apegrr a1ffATa, 1971 i 9RT 4 & 3U-ws (i), €s
(ﬁ)ﬁmﬁa%%aﬁﬁﬁmmﬁﬁ,%ﬁﬁuc&¢ﬁ@w
Ty B9 2~ (1) A 3eprel A& TR, AW (2) A ded FaIe
TR, ISR (3) A & YT Hifed, Tea 3] (4) 5 d&d Fok
arfed, ACE| |

3. SO YBHA F 3uH TN fhU S & forw uearfad aan
feeel R e RfATa, 1971 & 4RT 4 & 3UEs (i) & @3
() gRT fopd 91T T fAeafaf@a & -

C

l / }

Rajendra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Welfare,
SC/ST, WCD. Co-operative, GE
Govt. of NCT of Delhi




(i) ATAfaTs & arr 4 & @z (@) :ﬁ, Al TSTT" Aeg & TATT W
"TH HE Ll QTeg TW ST |

(il) g7 4 & @ () & sUEs (i) 7, ---

() "IR e FT" AeGl &b TUTH W "UTg &I Qe TW T4

(sfh) ereg "HR" @Y ger e srwa .
(@) A TEd g AfRd, Alds” A<l F Alg, U BISH AN 3T
"R (5) N ICd HCHAT Wiew, Tead T, TS dena” e
ST |

4. TI9Te 3UYh 3T Y UTH L &l UITH T |

/
feATen:-
gt (RToig; TTet Titera)
) (ARG GIDRE R
TR 74T 817 feeel TR

Rajendra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Welfare,
SC/ST, WCD, Co-operative, GE
Govt. of NCT of Dethi




VAo faue § grEifte o

feeel Rre TogRT  (WEiem
_ ) fadas, 2022 fHEdr i
UeTieeal @t faur &t sifafed wfdd wer =8 & gl a{zﬁqu

/v'

(SiE TS TivaH)
I, TEERT g e
P o & el WAER
Rajendra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Welfare,

SC/ST, WCD. Co-operative, GE
Govt. of NCT of Delhi




fa<ita s

fewlt R egrr (@=iym) 89w, 2022 & TP o A R
& gAfbd R § @15 faxg Hfeard wte =8 2

L4

Rajendra Pal Gautam
Minister of Social Welfare,
SC/ST, WCD, Co-operative, GE
Govt. of NCT of Delhi



